
Results of the NGA Spring Meet Auction
2011 Spring Brood Auction 

   1 GABLE INDIA (GABLE DODGE-CLARE LOTTIE*)
	    F 01/09/2005 HARLYN OR JANNA GOEBEL
Vince Berland,$1,600.00
   2 FLYING EUFAULA (FLYING PENSKE-FLYING SWEET AMY)
    F 12/03/2005 VINCE BERLAND
H. Hal Gill,$2,500.00
   3 WHITE GREYHOUND 
    BURK GREYHOUNDS
Rhonda Bartley $300             
   4 SAN TAN NIP (STATE OF THE ART-SAN TAN NIPPER)
    F 11/13/2004 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
H. Hal Gill,$5,000.00
   5 CRY   FINLEY (GABLE OSCAR-OFF THE BENCH)
    F 05/13/2007 CAMERON YOUNTS
David Blair,$400.00
   6 LADY AND GREYHOUND BURK GREYHOUNDS
Helen Godby $300                
   7 GABLE SCRAT (GABLE OSCAR-BRATWURST N BEER)
    F 11/19/2006 HARLYN OR JANNA GOEBEL
Passed ($800)                   
   8   FLYING TARA (KIOWA SWEET TREY-ROYAL TARA)
    F 09/08/2004 VINCE BERLAND
Passed ($400)
   9 PENCIL DRAWING  
    BURK GREYHOUNDS
Helen Godby $150

   10 TORNADO TOES (FLYING HYDROGEN-SAN TAN NIP)
     F 05/25/2008 JANET R. ALLEN
Passed ($2,250)
   11 CRY PARKER (GABLE OSCAR-OFF THE BENCH)
     F 05/13/2007 JAMES M. YOUNTS
David Blair,$700.00 
   12 FRAMED DRAWING 
     BURK GREYHOUNDS
S. Lester Raines $200
   13 GABLE SAM BABY (GABLE DODGE-B B BLUES)
     F 09/14/2004 HARLYN OR JANNA GOEBEL
Bob Hardison,$1,200.00
   14   FLYING EMMY (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KIOWA PENSKE FLY)
     F  3/ 5/2009 VINCE BERLAND
David Blair,$1,000.00
   15 PRINCESS DAGMAR 
     BURK GREYHOUNDS
Harvey Maupin,$325
   16 EXCEEDED DREAM (EXTRUDING DREAM-USS TOP DOLLY-IU)
    F 01/20/2007 RANDY FINEGAN OR JOSEPH A METRANO
Scratched  
   17 GABLE KISATCHIE (GABLE DODGE-SEEGOLD PANACHE)
     F 06/26/2005 FLYING EAGLES KENNEL
Jay Rangel,$3,500.00
   18 CRY TAYLOR (CRY GILBERT-GOLD DIGGER)
     F 04/15/2006 CAMERON YOUNTS
David Blair,$400.00

Racing Stock Auction
Since 1998

	 No.	N o.	T otal	A verage	
	C onsigned	 Sold	I ntake	 Price	

Spring 1998	 524	 143	    $925,800	 $6,474
Fall 1998	 794	 173	    $943,250	 $5,452
Spring 1999	 441	 130	 $1,017,600	 $7,827
Fall 1999	 650	 174	 $1,057,500	 $6,079
Spring 2000	 612	 147	 $1,128,900	 $7,679
Fall 2000	 775	 201	 $1,636,600	 $8,142
Spring 2001	 658	 165	 $1,261,950	 $7,648
Fall 2001	 717	 169	 $1,264,100	 $7,479
Spring 2002	 606	 142	    $971,300	 $6,840
Fall 2002	 673	 148	 $1,073,350	 $7,252
Spring 2003	 632	 134	 $1,024,250	 $7,643
Fall 2003	 712	 170	 $1,105,800	 $6,504
Spring 2004	 623	 174	 $1,173,250	 $6,742
Fall 2004	 816	 168	 $1,184,550	 $7,050
Spring 2005	 573	 173	 $1,255,100	 $7,254
Fall 2005	 835	 176	 $1,185,250	 $6,734
Spring 2006	 528	 188	 $1,402,300	 $7,459
Fall 2006	 742	 188	 $1,295,000	 $6,888
Spring 2007	 521	 169	 $1,572,450	 $9,304
Fall 2007	 608	 162	 $1,158,900	 $7,153
Spring 2008	 477	 178	 $1,327,250	 $7,456
Fall 2008	 709	 205	 $1,044,950	 $5,097 
Spring 2009	 548	 156	    $920,800	 $5,902
Fall 2009	 436	 122	    $622,500	 $5,102
Spring 2010	 352	 123	    $764,700	 $6,217
Fall 2010	 423	 127	    $702,450	 $5,531
Spring 2011	 233	 111	    $745,550	 $6,717

	 No.	N o.	T otal	A verage	
	C onsigned	 Sold	I ntake	 Price	

Spring 1998	 56	 25	 $  38,150	 $1,589	
Fall 1998	 83	 43	 $  68,100	 $1,584	
Spring 1999	 75	 36	 $  64,000	 $1,729	
Fall 1999	 91	 47	 $  74,150 	 $1,577	
Spring 2000	 85	 49	 $  90,000	 $1,836	
Fall 2000	 86	 44	 $  88,850	 $2,019	
Spring 2001	 68	 43	 $  81,700	 $1,900	
Fall 2001	 101	 44	 $  53,950	 $1,226	
Spring 2002	 62	 45	 $100,000	 $2,222	
Fall 2002	 80	 47	 $87,800	 $1,868	
Spring 2003	 63	 36	 $63,000	 $1,750
Fall 2003	 97	 58	 $116,500	 $2,008
Spring 2004	 83	 38	 $78,300	 $2,060
Fall 2004	 111	 35	 $35,600	 $1,017
Spring 2005	 60	 35	 $62,400	 $1,782
Fall 2005	 67	 27	 $58,050	 $2,150
Spring 2006	 45	 22	 $33,600	 $1,527
Fall 2006	 37	 18	 $36,000	 $2,036
Spring 2007	 44	 22	 $64,000	 $2,909
Fall 2007	 98	 50	 $75,350	 $1,507
Spring 2008	 50	 28	 $51,850	 $1,851
Fall 2008	 74	 37	 $46,050	 $1,244
Spring 2009	 31	 13	 $31,350	 $2,411
Fall 2009	 15	 1	 $1,300	 $1,300
Spring 2010	 6	 6	 $8,500	 $1,416
Fall 2010	 6	 3	 $3,700	 $1,233
Spring 2011	 13	 9	 $16,300	 $1,811

BROOD MATRON AUCTION
Since 1998



   19 HOUNDS AND COYOTE 
     BURK GREYHOUNDS
Helen Godby $100
 

 2011 Spring Racing Stock Auction
   1  TK TOP FLIGHT  (DODG  BY DESIGN-ROOFTOP LADYBUG)
    F 12/19/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
Green Smith,$11,500.00
   2  KB’S DECATUR  (LONESOME CRY-T PO JITTERSTIK)
    F 12/14/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Randy Sadusky,$1,250.00
   3  LL’S BOOTS  (SAN TAN FANG-SAN TAN CRISMISS)
    F 12/24/2009 ROBERT LAMBERT
Scratched
   4  KB’S MILLSAP  (YAHOO OMAR-B F PINA)
    M 12/27/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Green S   Mith,$3,500.00
   5  WW KAY PIT BULL (KIOWA WW BROTHER-JG’S 
KOREAN WAR)
    M 12/03/2009 JULIA WARD
Scratched 
   6  NITRO GRAND PRIX  (DEERFIELD SITE*-USS SANTA ANA)
    M 12/14/2009 TAMMY PIPER
Scratched
   7  WW KAY DOBERMAN  (KIOWA WW BROTHER-JG’S 
KOREAN WAR)
    M 12/03/2009 JULIA WARD
Scratched
   8  SAN TAN QUIKDEAL (TK QUICK STRIKE-I’M LOVIN IT)
    M 12/16/2009 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
Arthur Agganis,$5,500.00
   9  KB’S NATALIA  (DODG  BY DESIGN-FLYING RED ROSE)
    F 12/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Norman L. Rader,$5,000.00
  10  TK MAD MONEY  (DODG  BY DESIGN-ROOFTOP LADYBUG)
   F 12/19/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
Green Smith,$13,000.00
  11  SE’S GOODS  (RED RANGER-OZSUM MOONMIST)
   F 12/ 6/2009 STEVEN A. WARD
Green Smith,$8,000.00
  12  SAN TAN LAMBERT  (TK QUICK STRIKE-I’M LOVIN IT)
   M 12/16/2009 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
Passed ($4,000) 
  13  LL’S BUCKLE  (SAN TAN FANG-SAN TAN CRISMISS)
   F 12/24/2009 ROBERT LAMBERT
Scratched
  14  KB’S NECHES  (DODG  BY DESIGN- FLYING RED ROSE)
   F 12/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Green Smith,$1,250.00
  15  WS DROP A LINE  (KIOWA WW BROTHER-WS L ON DROPS)
   M 12/ 5/2009 JULIA WARD OR H. L. SWARTZENDRUBER
Scratched
  16  KB’S DECORDOVA  (LONESOME CRY-T PO JITTERSTIK)
   F 12/14/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
   Michael R. Seeger,$1,250.00
  17  NITRO WHIPLASH  (DEERFIELD SITE*-USS SANTA ANA)
   F 12/14/2009 TAMMY PIPER
Scratched
  18  KB’S DIMMITT  (LONESOME CRY-TRACK BABY)
   M 12/23/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Green Smith,$9,000.00
  19  LL’S COWGIRL  (SAN TAN FANG-SAN TAN CRISMISS)
   F 12/24/2009 ROBERT LAMBERT
Scratched

   20  LADY OPAL  (TK QUICK STRIKE-JULIE’S SONG)
    F 12/21/2009 BEVERLY JOHNSON
Passed No Bid
   21  KB’S NOCONA  (DODG BY DESIGN-FLYING RED ROSE)
    F 12/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Green Smith,$2,500.00
   22  WW KAY BOXER  (KIOWA WW BROTHER-JG’S KOREAN WAR)
    M 12/03/2009 JULIA WARD
Scratched,
   23  SAN TAN PIPETTE  (SAN TAN FANG-SANTAN PIPEDREA M)
    F 12/30/2009 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
Scratched
   24  KB’S NORMANGEE  (DODG BY DESIGN-FLYING RED 
ROSE)
    M 12/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Green Smith,$3,000.00
   25  BEAN  (TK QUICK STRIKE-JULIE’S SONG)
    M 12/21/2009 BEVERLY JOHNSON
Norman L. Rader,$5,500.00
   26  WW KAY HOUND  (KIOWA WW BROTHER-JG’S KOREAN WAR)
    F 12/03/2009 JULIA WARD
Scratched
   27  PTL TIPPER  (COLDWATER TORRES-PTL LINDA)
    F 12/22/2009 JOHN STEINER
Arthur Agganis,$6,000.00
   28  SE’S BOBBY BOY  (RED RANGER-OZSUM MOONMIST)
    M 12/ 6/2009 STEVEN A. WARD
Colleen Pace,$6,000.00
   29  SAN TAN STRIKE  (TK QUICK STRIKE-I’M LOVIN IT)
    M 12/16/2009 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
Scratched
   30  SAN TAN QUIKTRIP  (TK QUICK STRIKE-I’M LOVIN IT)
    M 12/16/2009 KENNETH E. OR JANET R. ALLEN
Scratched
   31  SE’S GLORY BOUND  (RED RANGER-OZSUM 
MOONMIST)
    F 12/ 6/2009 STEVEN A. WARD
Vincent Savill,$1,500.00
   32  LADY PIPER  (TK QUICK STRIKE-JULIE’S SONG)
    F 12/21/2009 BEVERLY JOHNSON
Scratched
   33  WW KAY BULL DOG  (KIOWA WW BROTHER-JG’S 
KOREAN WAR)
    M 12/03/2009 JULIA WARD
Vincent Savill,$5,250.00
   34  ALLIGATOR ALLEY  (BUZZ AROUND-MYSTIC MAUDINE)
    M 12/17/2009 MAUDINE HAMILTON
Scratched
   35  KB’S NAVASOTA  (YAHOO OMAR-B F PINA)
    F 12/27/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
James Blanchard,$3,000.00
   36  BUGSY    MALONE  (YO MY MEDIATOR-LEPRECHAUN*)
    M  1/ 3/2010 JON ARNO OR BURTON K. ARNO
Scratched
   37  SE’S STAR LEIA (TNT STAR WARS-OZSUM FLYBY)
    F  2/18/2010 STEVEN A. WARD
Arthur Agganis,$3,500.00
   38  CRAIGIE WIN TER  (FUZZYS CANNON-CRAIGIE 
SOCIALIT)
    M  1/25/2010 JOHN C. BOYD
Passed ($1,250)
   39  RUGBY ROY  (BD’S PHILLIP-OUR NIKKIE)
    M  2/27/2010 P. C. BARNHOORN
Scratched



   40  SEEGOLD DAYZ  (GOOD GUESS-SEEGOLD JANE)
     F  1/ 6/2010 PETER LIMMER
Scratched
   41  SE’S RAGE N ICE  (IC AN BRUTUS*-FLYING ZAHARIAS)
    M  2/ 9/2010 STEVEN A. WARD
Ronald Bond,$2,500.00
   42  SEEGOLD GUESS  (GOOD GUESS-SEEGOLD JANE)
    M  1/ 6/2010 PETER LIMMER
Passed No Bid
   43  SA   MBO  (YO MY MEDIATOR-LEPRECHAUN*)
    M  1/ 3/2010 JON ARNO OR BURTON K. ARNO
Scratched
   44  CRAIGIE I A M RED  (LONESOME CRY-CRAIGIE CRIMSON)
    M  1/ 4/2010 JOHN C. BOYD
Randy Finegan,$12,000.00
   45  TURBO PORSHA  (TURBO PENSKE-TURBO WIND BURN)
    F  1/17/2010 EDWARD F. GARDNER, JR.
Scratched
   46  CRAIGIE SOLTICE  ( FUZZYS CANNON-CRAIGIE SOCIALIT)
    F  1/25/2010 JOHN C. BOYD
James Blanchard,$2,250.00
   47  SE’S COMMA STAR  (TNT STAR WARS-OZSUM   FLYBY)
    F  2/18/2010 STEVEN A. WARD
Chris Politis,$4,000.00
   48  CINNABAR  (YO MY MEDIATOR-LEPRECHAUN*)
    M  1/ 3/2010 JON ARNO OR BURTON K. ARNO
Scratched
   49  TURBO PAULO (TURBO PENSKE-TURBO WIND BURN)
    M  1/17/2010 EDWARD F. GARDNER, JR.
Passed ($5,000)
   50  CRAIGIE SPRINTER (FUZZYS CANNON-CRAIGIE 
SOCIALIT)
    M  1/25/2010 JOHN C. BOYD
Passed ($1,250)
   51  EPICENTER  (YO MY MEDIATOR-LEPRECHAUN*)
    M  1/ 3/2010 JON ARNO OR BURTON K. ARNO
Passed ($8,500)
   52  SE’S CHEWIE  (TNT STAR WARS-OZSUM FLYBY)
    M  2/18/2010 STEVEN A. WARD
Chris Pal   Mieri, Jr.,$1,250.00
   53  TURBO PACO  (TURBO PENSKE-TURBO WIND BURN)
    M  1/17/2010 EDWARD F. GARDNER, JR.
Lamar Porter,$4,500.00
   54  SE’S JANGO (TNT STAR WARS-OZSUM FLYBY)
    M  2/18/2010 STEVEN A. WARD
Vince Berland,$3,000.00
   55  CRAIGIE I AM JAK  (LONESOME CRY-CRAIGIE CRIMSON)
    M  1/ 4/2010 JOHN C. BOYD
Michelle or Tammy Edgar,$2,500.00
   56  CRAIGIE I AMRITA  (LONESOME CRY-CRAIGIE CRIMSON)
    F  1/ 4/2010 JOHN C. BOYD
Colleen Pace,$8,000.00
   57  TURBO PAULA  (TURBO PENSKE-TURBO WIND BURN)
    F  1/17/2010 EDWARD   F. GARDNER, JR.
Passed ($3,000)
   58  BUDZ GUMP  (KIOWA MON MANNY-CRAIGIE MAXI)
    M  9/ 8/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Harvey Maupin,$3,250.00
   59  PTL BUBBA  (ETHEREAL EAGLE-CAJUN BLOND)
    M  8/ 9/2009 JOHN STEINER
Passed No Bid
   60  KB’S HIDALGO  (RHYTHMLESS-HH LEXUS LADY)
    M  8/15/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Joe Trudden,$2,250.00
  

   61  WHISTLER’S MASS  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-SOFT TRENT)
    F  8/28/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
   62  GO BON FIRED UP (FLYING HYDROGEN-GO BON PURE EVIL)
    F  9/16/2009 GORDON HEATH
Passed No Bid
   63  BUDZ BRYNNA  (CRAIGIE BROOKER-CRAIGIE ZEE)
    F  9/26/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Passed No Bid
   64  TK BIG LIGHTS  (COLDWATER KONOW- FUZZYS HELENA)
    M  9/17/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
John Weber ,$2,250.00
   65  INSTANTLY FLEET  (PACIFIC MILE*-INSTANT LEE)
    F  8/16/2009 S. BOATRIGHT,   F. PEARSON OR J. MELILLO
Scratched
   66  KB’S HARLINGEN  (RHYTHMLESS-HH LEXUS LADY)
    F  8/15/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Norman L. Rader,$3,500.00
   67  LD WEIHL ON BY  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-LIZ WEIHL)
    M  8/12/2009 DEBRA BINEGAR
Scratched
   68  TK FORWARD MOTION  (FLYING PENSKE-CAJUN FANTASY)
    M  9/17/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
Rodney Cooley,$15,500.00
   69  KB’S JUDSON  (RHYTHMLESS-BOH IAN GINGER)
    F  9/ 2/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Randy Finegan,$7,000.00
   70  INSTANTLY HASTY  (PACIFIC MILE*-INSTANT LEE)
    M  8/16/2009 S. BOATRIGHT, F. PEARSON OR J. MELILLO
Bean & Stout,$8,500.00
   71  NB’S RED ALERT (TROJAN CRUZE-ULTIMATE DEVA)
    M  9/ 5/2009 BOBBY SIDHU
Scratched
   72  HUG N RAC (DODG BY DESIGN-ANITA HUG)
    M  9/ 5/2009 HARLAND V. OLSON
James Blanchard,$3,000.00
   73  WHISTLER’S STATE  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-DRIVEN LEE)
    M  8/ 1/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
   74  BI’S OH CEE  (LONESOME CRY-TIPP GINA)
    F  9/ 3/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE OR DAN ISELT
Bob Rider,$12,000.00
   75  TK SHAKE N BAKE  (COLDWATER KONOW-FUZZYS HELENA)
    F  9/17/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
Randy Sadusky,$1,250.00
   76  WHISTLER’S LORD  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-DRIVEN LEE)
    M  8/ 1/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
   77  BUDZ PAYTON  (CRAIGIE BROOKER-CRAIGIE ZEE)
    F  9/26/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Passed No Bid
   78  KELLS LADY ROSE  (SOPRANO DRIVE-R’S FLAMING FURY)
    F  9/ 1/2009 JOHN DALTON
Michelle White,$2,750.00
   79 FORTUNE TELLER  (CTW LEGENDARY-FOOLISH FANTASIA)
    M  9/15/2009 GREGORIO LEYVA
Scratched
   80  HUG N PASS   (DODG BY DESIGN-ANITA HUG)
    F  9/ 5/2009 HARLAND V. OLSON
Passed No Bid
   81  KB’S DROOPING  (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-T PO ARTIC FOX)
    M  8/ 1/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Christina Newsome,$1,500.00
  
   



82  BUDZ CROCKETT  (CRAIGIE BROOKER-CRAIGIE ZEE)
    M  9/26/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Passed No Bid 
   83  POSSESSIVE TRENT  (TRENT LEE-OKIE LYNDA)
    F  9/ 5/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
   84  RAIN FALL (WW APPLE JAX-KAY V NORTH)
    F  8/27/2009 H. HAL GILL
Passed ($1,500)
   85  HS CAT FISH (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KB’S TURBO TOES)
    M  8/ 1/2009 WILLIS HILL
Lamar Porter,$6,000.00
   86  EASY PICKINGS (CTW LEGENDARY- FOOLISH FANTASIA)
    F  9/15/2009 GREGORIO LEYVA
Scratched
   87  BUDZ TRIX  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-GREYS TORRINGTON)
    F  8/ 3/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Thomas Ferris,$4,250.00
   88  SIMPLY GONE  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-ICU GORGEOUS)
    F  9/ 1/2009 JULIUS C. RICHEY
Scratched
   89  HUG N LEAV   (DODG BY DESIGN-ANITA HUG)
    F  9/ 5/2009 HARLAND V. OLSON
Passed No Bid
   90  BUDZ CROSBY  (KIOWA MON MANNY-CRAIGIE MAXI)
    M  9/ 8/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Randy Finegan,$1,500.0
   91  HS JAYVEE  (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KB’S TURBO TOES)
    M  8/ 1/2009 WILLIS HILL
Passed No Bid
   92  GO BON GLORY B  ( FLYING HYDROGEN-GO BON PURE EVIL)
    F  9/16/2009 GORDON HEATH
Kevin Fish ,$5,500.00
   93  EPIC TRENT  (TRENT LEE-OKIE LYNDA)
    M  9/ 5/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
   94  KB’S HUFFMAN  (RHYTHMLESS-HH LEXUS LADY)
    M  8/15/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Norman L. Rader,$5,250.00
   95  HS TIPPY  (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KB’S TURBO TOES)
    F  8/ 1/2009 WILLIS HILL
Scratched
   96  LD WEIHL CATCH  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-LIZ WEIHL)
    M  8/12/2009 DEBRA BINEGAR
Scratched
   97  BUDZ KOBIE  (CRAIGIE BROOKER-CRAIGIE ZEE)
    F  9/26/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Passed No Bid
   98  INSTANTLY ATOMIC  (PACIFIC MILE*-INSTANT LEE)
    M  8/16/2009 S. BOATRIGHT, F. PEARSON OR J. MELILLO
Bean & Stout,$6,750.00
   99  BI’S TOOTERS  (LONESOME CRY-TIPP GINA)
    M  9/ 3/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE OR DAN ISELT
Green Smith,$20,000.00
  100  BUDZ CISCO  (CRAIGIE BROOKER-CRAIGIE ZEE)
    M  9/26/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Scratched
  101  TK BLACK MAMBA  (FLYING PENSKE-CAJUN FANTASY)
    M  9/17/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
H. Hal Gill,$23,500.00
  102  RT MISS MARY  (DODG  BY DESIGN-PTL BOO BOO)
    F  9/ 8/2009 RUFUS TATUM
Passed No Bid
 

  103  BUDZ SAUZA  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-CRAIGIE BEAUTY)
    M  8/29/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
George Heise,$1,250.00
  104  KB’S COMORAS  (LONESOME CRY-HOT KISSES)
    F  8/29/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
James Campbell,$1,250.00
  105  TK HOT WIRED  (COLDWATER KONOW-FUZZYS HELENA)
    F  9/17/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
Brian Lewis,$1,000
  106  CORRECT TRENT  (TRENT LEE-OKIE LYNDA)
    M  9/ 5/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
  107  NB’S DIAMONDS  (TROJAN CRUZE-ULTIMATE DEVA)
    F  9/ 5/2009 BOBBY SIDHU
Scratched
  108  SWEET SPRING  (KIOWA SWEET TREY-SPRING MEET)
    F  8/ 5/2009 JOHN M. MELILLO
Norman L. Rader,$4,250.00
  109  KB’S VALLERI  (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-T PO ARTIC FOX)
    F  8/ 1/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
John  Weber,$1,750.00
  110  BAY OAKS JET  (DODG  BY DESIGN-LEGS OCELOT)
    M  9/ 6/2009 WILLIAM G. CRISS
Passed ($5,750)
  111  INSTANTLY XPRESS  (PACIFIC MILE*-INSTANT LEE)
    F  8/16/2009 S. BOATRIGHT, F. PEARSON OR J. MELILLO
Bean & Stout,$4,000.00
  112  WHISTLER’S WRATH (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-SOFT TRENT)
    F  8/28/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
  113  WHISTLER’S CATCH  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-DRIVEN LEE)
    F  8/ 1/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
  114  BUDZ SYKES  (KIOWA MON MANNY-CRAIGIE MAXI)
    M  9/ 8/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Scratched
  115  KELLS BARRACUDA  (SOPRANO DRIVE-R’S FLAMING   FURY)
    M  9/ 1/2009 JOHN DALTON
Passed ($1,500)
  116  GRAND SENORITA  (CTW LEGENDARY- FOOLISH FANTASIA)
    F  9/15/2009 GREGORIO LEYVA
Vincent Savill,$1,250.00
  117  KB’S JOSHUA  (RHYTHMLESS-BOH IAN GINGER)
    M  9/ 2/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Jay   Fowler ,$2,000.00
  118  BUDZ JENCY  (CRAIGIE BROOKER-CRAIGIE ZEE)
    F  9/26/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Passed ($1,250)
  119  CROWN ME GONE  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-ICU GORGEOUS)
    M  9/ 1/2009 JULIUS C. RICHEY
Norman L. Rader,$5,500.00
  120  STAR GUITAR  (WIGWAM WAG-ROOFTOP JABBER)
    M  9/29/2009 H. HAL GILL
Passed ($3,250)                
  121  SUR   FACE TRENT  (TRENT LEE-OKIE LYNDA)
    F  9/ 5/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
  122  BROKEN DESIRE (KIOWA SWEET TREY- MY DARK ANGEL)
    M  8/ 3/2009 GREGORIO LEYVA
Passed No Bid
  123  HS BOLT  (KIOWA SWEET TREY-KB’S TURBO TOES)
    M  8/ 1/2009 WILLIS HILL
Vince Berland,$12,000.00



  124  WHISTLER’S QUEEN  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-SOFT TRENT)
    F  8/28/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
  125  KB’S SKIPPER  (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-T PO ARTIC FOX)
    M  8/ 1/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Passed No Bid
  126  BUDZ CHEWY  (CRAIGIE BROOKER-CRAIGIE ZEE)
    M  9/26/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Passed No Bid
  127  HUG N HOLD (DODG  BY DESIGN-ANITA HUG)
    F  9/ 5/2009 HARLAND V. OLSON
Passed No Bid
  128  LD WEIHLCOMPLETE  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-LIZ WEIHL)
    M  8/12/2009 DEBRA BINEGAR
Scratched
  129  GO BON JOLENE  (FLYING HYDROGEN-GO BON PURE EVIL)
    F  9/16/2009 GORDON HEATH
Scratched
  130  GO BON WALKNAWAY (FLYING HYDROGEN-GO BON 
PURE EVIL)
    M  9/16/2009 GORDON HEATH
Passed ($4,750)
  131  BUDZ SHELBY  (KIOWA MON MANNY-CRAIGIE MAXI)
    F  9/ 8/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Scratched
  132  HUG N DODG   (DODG BY DESIGN-ANITA HUG)
    M  9/ 5/2009 HARLAND V. OLSON
Ja   Mes Blanchard,$4,500.00
  133  KB’S HOCKLEY  (RHYTHMLESS-HH LEXUS LADY)
    F  8/15/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Nor   Man L. Rader,$6,000.00
  134  NB’S STORM FORCE (TROJAN CRUZE-ULTIMATE DEVA)
    M  9/ 5/2009 BOBBY SIDHU
Scratched
  135  RT MISS CHARGER  (DODG  BY DESIGN-PTL BOO BOO)
    F  9/ 8/2009 RUFUS TATUM
Passed No Bid                  
  136  KB’S JAYTON  (RHYTHMLESS-BOH IAN GINGER)
    F  9/ 2/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
La   Mar Porter,$3,500.00
  137  BUDZ SERRANO  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-CRAIGIE BEAUTY)
    M  8/29/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Scratched
  138  INSTANTLY GROOVY  (PACIFIC MILE*-INSTANT LEE)
    F  8/16/2009 S. BOATRIGHT, F. PEARSON OR J. MELILLO
Scratched
  139  WHISTLER’S WHIRL (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-SOFT TRENT)
    F  8/28/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
  140  TK GOLDEN DREAM  (FLYING PENSKE-CAJUN FANTASY)
    F  9/17/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
John  Weber,$3,000.00
  141  BI’S COLE  (LONESOME CRY-TIPP GINA)
      M  9/ 3/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE OR DAN ISELT
Green Smith,$12,500.00
  142  BUDZ QUINCY  (CRAIGIE BROOKER-CRAIGIE ZEE)
    M  9/26/2009 CRAIGIE, INC.
Passed ($1,250)
  143  INSTANTLY CHASE  (PACIFIC MILE*-INSTANT LEE)
    M  8/16/2009 S. BOATRIGHT, F. PEARSON OR J. MELILLO
James Campbell,$2,750.00
  144  LD WEIHL SASSY  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-LIZ WEIHL)
    F  8/12/2009 DEBRA BINEGAR
Scratched

  145  HEARTACHE  (CTW LEGENDARY- FOOLISH FANTASIA)
    M  9/15/2009 GREGORIO LEYVA
Lamar Porter,$2,500.00
  146  WHISTLER’S FAME  (CRAIGIE WHISTLER-DRIVEN LEE)
    F  8/ 1/2009 EVERYTIME ENTERPRISES, LLC
Scratched
  147  KELLS ANGEL FIRE  (SOPRANO DRIVE-R’S FLAMING FURY)
    F  9/ 1/2009 JOHN DALTON
Passed ($1,750)
  148  TK BARE DOWN  (COLDWATER KONOW- FUZZYS HELENA)
    M  9/17/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
Lee Mundus ,$1,250.00
  149  KELLS DANNY BOY  (ATASCOCITA LEROY-TOO LATE)
    M 10/12/2009 JOHN DALTON
Green Smith,$26,000.00
  150  WINDY SIDNEY  (MACFARLANE-BARTS LUCINDA)
    M 10/ 1/2009 ALAN MURRAY OR MARCY L. STRONG
Harvey Maupin,$5,000.00
  151  KB’S BOGATO  (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-LIL KACI)
    M 10/ 7/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Alan Rankin,$1,250.00
  152  SWITZLER THYME  (COLDWATER KEELIN-SWITZLER 
TEATIME)
    M 10/ 9/2009 HELEN L. STOUT
Kevin Fish,$3,000.00
  153  GIT N EVEN  (DODG  BY DESIGN- FOREVER NANC)
    F 10/29/2009 ROBERT CROSSLAND
Scratched
  154  KB’S MALAKOFF (DODG  BY DESIGN-CHERRY JUBILEE*)
    M 10/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Lamar Porter,$3,000.00
  155  SWITZLER MUSTARD (COLDWATER KEELIN-SWITZLER 
TEATIME)
    F 10/ 9/2009 HELEN L. STOUT
S. Lester Raines,$18,000.00
  156  KELLS TALLY HO  (ATASCOCITA LEROY-TOO LATE)
    M 10/12/2009 JOHN DALTON
William McCarthy,$2,750.00
  157  DAY THRILLER (ROOFTOP HARDSPOT-ROOFTOP SENECA)
    F 10/ 2/2009 GLENN C. JONES
Passed No Bid
  158  HS BLACKBERRY (FLYING PENSKE-DALCASH VINTAGE*)
    F 10/ 9/2009 WILLIS HILL
Lamar Porter,$2,500.00
  159  KB’S MATAGORDA  (DODG  BY DESIGN-CHERRY 
JUBILEE*)
    M 10/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Norman L. Rader,$6,000.00
  160  SWITZLER SEASALT  (COLDWATER KEELIN-SWITZLER 
TEATIME)
    M 10/ 9/2009 HELEN L. STOUT
Norman L. Rader,$5,000.00
  161 MAN ON FIRE (ROOFTOP HARDSPOT-ROOFTOP SENECA)
    M 10/ 2/2009 GLENN C. JONES
Passed ($5,000)
  162  KB’S MARION  (DODG  BY DESIGN-CHERRY JUBILEE*)
    F 10/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Harvey Maupin,$9,000.00
  163  TK POWER PLAY  (WW TIME WARP-WHYTELL SKYLER)
    M 10/ 1/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
Kevin Fish ,$2,500.00
  164 FARREN GLEN  (DODG  BY DESIGN-HEATHER GLEN)
    M 10/ 1/2009 JOHN M. MELILLO
Scratched



  165  KELLS OUTLAW  (ATASCOCITA LEROY-TOO LATE)
    M 10/12/2009 JOHN DALTON
Terry Scott,$16,000.00
  166  WINDY RITA  (MACFARLANE-BARTS LUCINDA)
    F 10/ 1/2009 ALAN MURRAY OR MARCY L. STRONG
Scratched
  167  KB’S CARMINE  (TEAM RECORD*-BI’S HUNTER)
    F 10/27/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Rodney Cooley,$9,500.00
  168  ACTION PLAN  (BE MY BUBBA-RISE TO GLORY)
    M 10/14/2009 GREGORIO LEYVA
Scratched
  169  BAH BAH BOOEY (DODG  BY DESIGN- FOREVER NANC)
    F 10/29/2009 CHRISTOPHER CODEY
Scratched
  170  D’BULLS KETCHUM  (KIOWA SWEET TREY-SASSYS LIL 
SALLY)
    M 10/ 1/2009 SALLY BULLARD
Scratched
  171  KB’S   FLOMOT  (DODG  BY DESIGN-CZ WAKEUPLILSUSI)
    M 10/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Kevin Fish,$1,500.00
  172  KB’S BAGWELL  (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-LIL KACI)
    M 10/ 7/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Kevin Fish,$2,500.00
  173  KB’S BANDERA  (OSHKOSH SLAMMER-LIL KACI)
    F 10/ 7/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Edward F. Gardner, Jr.,$5,250.00
  174  KELLS NEON   FLASH  (ATASCOCITA LEROY-TOO LATE)
    F 10/12/2009 JOHN DALTON
Brad Bolten,$9,000.00
  175  D’BULLS PAINT ME  (KIOWA SWEET TREY-SASSYS LIL 
SALLY)
    M 10/ 1/2009 SALLY BULLARD
Scratched
  176  HS LUNA  (FLYING PENSKE-DALCASH VINTAGE*)
    F 10/ 9/2009 WILLIS HILL
Scratched
  177  CONFESSION (ROOFTOP HARDSPOT-ROOFTOP SENECA)
    M 10/ 2/2009 GLENN C. JONES
Scratched
  178  TK HIPPY CHICK  (WW TIME WARP-WHYTELL SKYLER)
    F 10/ 1/2009 MARTY D. TANNER
Arden Phi   Fer,$10,000.00
  179  KB’S MEDINA  (DODG  BY DESIGN-CHERRY JUBILEE*)
    F 10/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Lee Mundus,$1,250.00
  180  KELLS ARABIAN  (ATASCOCITA LEROY-TOO LATE)
    F 10/12/2009 JOHN DALTON
Norman L. Rader,$7,500.00
  181  WINDY SETH  (MACFARLANE-BARTS LUCINDA)
    M 10/ 1/2009 ALAN MURRAY OR MARCY L. STRONG
Harvey Maupin,$7,750.00
  182  GO BON CINDY  (SAN TAN WIPE OUT-PARTY POKER)
    F 10/ 1/2009 GORDON HEATH
Scratched
  183  GIT N PRETTY  (DODG  BY DESIGN- FOREVER NANC)
    F 10/29/2009 ROBERT CROSSLAND
Scratched
  184  KB’S MARLIN  (DODG  BY DESIGN-CHERRY JUBILEE*)
    M 10/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Scratched

  185  BILLIE JEAN (ROOFTOP HARDSPOT-ROOFTOP SENECA)
    F 10/ 2/2009 GLENN C. JONES
Scratched
  186  SWITZLER PEPPER  (COLDWATER KEELIN-SWITZLER 
TEATIME)
    M 10/ 9/2009 HELEN L. STOUT
Norman L. Rader,$5,250.00
  187  SWITZLER CLOVES  (COLDWATER KEELIN-SWITZLER 
TEATIME)
    M 10/ 9/2009 HELEN L. STOUT
Norman L. Rader,$16,000.00
  188  GIT N EXTR E  (DODG  BY DESIGN- FOREVER NANC)
    F 10/29/2009 ROBERT CROSSLAND
Scratched
  189  KB’S COTULLA  (TEAM RECORD*-BI’S HUNTER)
    F 10/27/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Steven M. Sarras,$7,500.00
  190  KB’S MARQUEZ (DODG  BY DESIGN-CHERRY JUBILEE*)
    F 10/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Steven M. Sarras,$12,000.00
  191  KB’S FRITCHER (DODG  BY DESIGN-CZ WAKEUPLILSUSI)
    M 10/ 9/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
C. Don Godby,$3,750.00
  192  SWITZLER PARSLEY  (COLDWATER KEELIN-SWITZLER 
TEATIME)
    F 10/ 9/2009 HELEN L. STOUT
Passed No Bid
  193  D’BULLS SAY WHEN  (KIOWA SWEET TREY-SASSYS LIL 
SALLY)
    M 10/ 1/2009 SALLY BULLARD
Scratched
  194  WINDY RANDY  (MACFARLANE-BARTS LUCINDA)
    M 10/ 1/2009 ALAN MURRAY OR MARCY L. STRONG
William McCarthy,$15,500.00
  195  KB’S CAMDEN  (TEAM RECORD*-BI’S HUNTER)
    M 10/27/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Green Smith,$19,000.00
  196  SWITZLER PAPRIKA  (COLDWATER KEELIN-SWITZLER 
TEATIME)
    F 10/ 9/2009 HELEN L. STOUT
John Weber,$2,000.00
  197  BARR GLEN  (DODG  BY DESIGN-HEATHER GLEN)
    M 10/ 1/2009 JOHN M. MELILLO
Scratched
  198  UB BABY BABY  (YO MY MEDIATOR-RC ASHLEY BLEU)
    F 11/16/2009 CHEYENNE CRISWELL OR ALAN PIPER
Scratched
  199  KEBO KAPSIZER (LONESOME CRY-GREYS WIND GATE)
    F 11/ 8/2009 ROBERT L. LITKE
Harvey Maupin,$17,000.00
  200  DANCIN SWEETY  (SUPER LEE-EL HOT PEPPER)
    F 11/ 2/2009 PETER LIMMER
Scratched
  201  KB’S MR. FULTON  (LONESOME CRY-USS HOT HEAD)
    M 11/10/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Thomas Ferris,$12,000.00
  202  HI NOON SURE LEE  (TRENT LEE-HI NOON CATWO   
MAN)
    F 11/ 3/2009 CHARLES HALIBURTON, III
Passed  ($1,500)
  203  HI NOON BENT LEE  (TRENT LEE-HI NOON CATWO MAN)
    M 11/ 3/2009 CHARLES HALIBURTON, III
Scratched



  204  KB’S DANBURY  (LONESOME CRY-LORI)
    M 11/ 5/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Lamar Porter,$5,500.00
  205  PEPPY  (LONESOME CRY-AFTER GLOW)
    F 11/11/2009 GREGORIO LEYVA
Scratched
  206  UB LUNATIC FRINGE (YO MY MEDIATOR-RC ASHLEY BLEU)
    M 11/16/2009 CHEYENNE CRISWELL OR ALAN PIPER
Scratched
  207  SE’S ROSE MARIE (RHYTHMLESS-SE’S SPARKAHEART)
    F 11/ 1/2009 STEVEN A. WARD
S. Lester Raines,$5,750.00
  208  UB EYEO FTHETIGER  (YO MY MEDIATOR-RC ASHLEY BLEU)
    M 11/16/2009 CHEYENNE CRISWELL OR ALAN PIPER
Green Smith,$8,000.00
  209  LONESOME AMIGO  (LONESOME CRY-AFTER GLOW)
    M 11/11/2009 GREGORIO LEYVA
Jeff Kessler,$4,000.00
  210  KEBO KLASSY KATE  (LONESOME CRY-GREYS WIND 
GATE)
    F 11/ 8/2009 ROBERT L. LITKE
Scratched                      
  211 MRL JET FUEL  (YO MY MEDIATOR- MRL LATTA)
    F 11/ 2/2009 MRL METALS, LLC
Passed ($2,000)
  212  INTERNET EXPERT (DODG  BY DESIGN-ROOFTOP SPOTTIE)
    F 11/ 2/2009 ALAN PIPER
Scratched
  213  SE’S SEQUOIA (KIOWA WW BROTHER-TIME FOR A PARTY)
    F 11/15/2009 PENNY D. WICK OR STEVEN A. WARD
Robert Britton,$23,000.00
  214  SE’S TALI WILLOW (KIOWA WW BROTHER-TIME FOR A PARTY)
    F 11/15/2009 PENNY D. WICK OR STEVEN A. WARD
Green Smith,$17,000.00
  215 MONEY MAGS  (DODG  BY DESIGN-ROOFTOP SPOTTIE)
    F 11/ 2/2009 ALAN PIPER
Scratched
  216  SHAWNEE PANTHER (KIOWA WW BROTHER-TIME FOR 
A PARTY)
    M 11/15/2009 STEVEN A. WARD OR MAUDINE HAMILTON
Scratched
  217  UB ENTER SANDMAN (YO MY MEDIATOR-RC ASHLEY BLEU)
    M 11/16/2009 CHEYENNE CRISWELL OR ALAN PIPER
Scratched
  218  DANCIN PAULY D  (SUPER LEE-EL HOT PEPPER)
    M 11/ 2/2009 PETER LIMMER
Scratched
  219  SE’S RICH RONNIE  (RHYTHMLESS-SE’S SPARKAHEART)
    M 11/ 1/2009 STEVEN A. WARD
Ronald Bond,$3,500.00
  220  HI NOON FINE LEE  (TRENT LEE-HI NOON CATWOMAN)
    F 11/ 3/2009 CHARLES HALIBURTON, III
Scratched
  221 MRL JACKPOT  (YO MY MEDIATOR- MRL LATTA)
    M 11/ 2/2009 MRL METALS, LLC
Scratched
  222  WHISKEY SLINGER (DODG  BY DESIGN-ROOFTOP SPOTTIE)
    M 11/ 2/2009 ALAN PIPER
Green Smith,$9,000.00
  223  KB’S SMOKIN JESS  (LONESOME CRY-USS HOT HEAD)
    M 11/10/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
William Lockhart,$17,500.00
 

   224  KB’S MIDLOTHIAN (WW TIME WARP-TK BATTLE TESTED)
    M 11/16/2009 KENNETH BIEHLE
Harvey Maupin,$5,500.00
  225  SE’S TALI ASPEN  (KIOWA WW BROTHER-TIME FOR A 
PARTY)
    F 11/15/2009 PENNY D. WICK OR STEVEN A. WARD
Terry Scott,$35,000.00
  226  LONESOME LATINO  (LONESOME CRY-AFTER GLOW)
    M 11/11/2009 GREGORIO LEYVA
Arlan Hall ,$1,800.00
  227  HI NOON TRUE LEE  (TRENT LEE-HI NOON CATWOMAN)
    F 11/ 3/2009 CHARLES HALIBURTON, III
Passed ($3,750)
  228  UB THUNDERSTRUCK (YO MY MEDIATOR-RC ASHLEY BLEU)
    M 11/16/2009 CHEYENNE CRISWELL OR ALAN PIPER
Scratched
  229  KEBO KOOBY KOO (LONESOME CRY-GREYS WIND GATE)
    F 11/ 8/2009 ROBERT L. LITKE
Scratched
  230 MRL JUST HEAT  (YO MY MEDIATOR- MRL LATTA)
    F 11/ 2/2009 MRL METALS, LLC
Scratched
  231  SE’S LAKOTAH  (KIOWA WW BROTHER-TIME FOR A 
PARTY)
   M 11/15/2009 PENNY D. WICK OR STEVEN A. WARD
James Blanchard,$4,500.00
  232  DANCIN TWEETY  (SUPER LEE-EL HOT PEPPER)
    F 11/ 2/2009 PETER LIMMER
Scratched
  233  LIZARD LICK  (DODG  BY DESIGN-ROOFTOP SPOTTIE)
   M 11/ 2/2009 ALAN PIPER
Scratched


